
1 

Sax 
BIDDERS EBS60-GL 

Music and Arts $2,168.39 

Lead Times 61-90 days
Playground 3% $2,125.00
Lead Times SUB/ 

Sweetwater NB 

LeaaTimes N/A 

Taylor NB 

LeadTinies N/A 

Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

BID REQUEST 25-01- BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

2 

Clarinet 
Selmer 
1440 

$6,879.80 
SUB 31-60 

days 

NB 

N/A 

$5,955.00 

SUB 15 days 

3 

Clarinet 
YCL-255 

$447.10 

7-14 days

$530.00

IN STOCK 

$387.22 
25 days 

$404.00 

is days 

4 

Flute YFL-
222 

$ 393.68 

7-14 days

$ 505.00 

IN STOCK 

$ 368.60 

25 days 

$ 388.00 

15 days 

5 

Sax 
Yamaha 
200AD11 

$ 1,087.74 
SUB 7-14 

days 

$ 1,040.00 

IN STOCK 

$ 942.06 

25 days 
NB 

N/A 

6 7 8 9 

Clarinet 
mouthpc clarinet Clarinet 
J&D Hite ligature Sax YAS- reed 
111 Rovner 1R 26 Legere 3 

$ 22.97 $ 16.61 $ 1,087.74 $ 17.42 

7-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days

NB NB $ 1,295.00 NB

IN STOCK 

$ 24.81 $ 24.99 $ 942.06 $ 21.56 

7 days 7 days 25 days 15 days 

$ 23.99 $ 19.99 $ 988.00 $ 20.49 

15 days 15 days 15 days 30 days 

10 11 12 

leblanc 
sax reed Clarinet Clarinet 
legere 3 7168 YCL221 II 

$ 17.42 $ 2,728.13 $ 2,341.92 

31-60 days 181 + days 7-14 days
NB $ 2,580.00 $ 2,120.00 

IN STOCK 

$ 21.56 $ 2,357.88 $ 2,028.27 

15 days 20 days 25 days 

$ 24.99 $ 2,344.00 $ 2,020.00 

30 days 15 days 15 days 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

lead Times 
Playground 3% 

lead Times 

Sweetwater 

lead Times 

Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 
Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

13 I 

Piccolo 
PFP105E 

I 
I $930.72 

61-90 days

$888.00

$827.76 

Feb 
$797.00 

15 days 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

14 

Clarinet MP 
Vandoren 
845 

$93.74 

7-14 days

$93.23 

7 days 

$84.99 
15 days 

I 15 

Sax 
YAS480 

$2,178.01 

7-14 days
$2,185.00

IN STOCK
$1,985.59

35 days
$1,988.00

15 days

I 16 I 

Sax 
YTS480 

$2,475.93 

7-14 days

$2,485.00

IN STOCK
$2,257.19

25 days
$2,249.00

15 days

17 

Oboe 
YOB441IIT 

$4,094.72 

31-60 days

$3,860.00 
IN STOCK 
$3,546.52 

25 days 
$3,993.00 

15 days 

I 18 

Oboe 
YOB841L 

$6,979.84 

61-60 days

$7,250.00

IN STOCK
$6,819.10

25 days
$6,788.00

15 days

I 19 I 

Piccolo YPC-
32 

$800.80 

61-90 days

$765.00

$693.SS 
Feb 

$699.00 

60days 

20 21 
bass 

Clarinet clarinet 
Reeds reeds 

Vandoren Vandoren 
Sz3 Sz3 

$22.99 $21.65 

7-14 days 7-14 days
NB NB

$24.57 $23.19 

7 days 7 days 
$22.99 $21.99 

15 days 15 days 

I 22 I 23 I 24 

Tenor Sax Alto Sax 
Reeds reeds Clarinet 

Vandoren Vandoren Royal 
Sz3 Sz3 Global 

$21.65 $29.90 $2,777.52 

SIJS7-14 

7-14 days 7-14 days days 

NB NB $1,680.00 

IN STOCK 

$23.19 $30.31 $1,246.91 
7 days 7 days 15 days 
$21.99 $28.99 NB 

is days 15 days N/A 



BID REQUEST25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

25 26 27 28 29 30 31 32 33 34 35 36 

Bassoon Baritone Sax Clarinet Bassoon Bassoon 
Fox model EBS-GL or Oboe YOB- Flute Leblanc Fox Model Selmer Sax Oboe Fox Clarinet YCL- Euphonium Tuba 

BIDDERS 41 EBS453 241 YFL382 L7181 51 1432B YSS475II Model 330 650 YEP-321 EBB231 

Music and Arts $6,216.00 $2,575.92 $1,849.12 $1,059.74 $6,879.80 $5,936.00 $5,237.57 $2,384.48 $3,976.00 $1,822.24 $2,371.04 $3,218.42 

Lead Times 181 + days 61-90 days 7-14 days 120-150 days 31-60 days 91-120 days 181 + days 151-180 days 181 + days 151-180 days 181 + days 31-60 days

Playground 3% $5,825.00 $2,485.00 $1,765.00 $1,000.00 $6,385.00 $5,550.00 $4,888.00 $2,255.00 $3,930.00 $1,710.00 $2,225.00 $2,225.00 

Lead Times EBS543 IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK 

Sweetwater $5,749.39 NB $1,601.47 $907.92 NB $5,492.39 $4,517.40 $2,065.13 $3,904.15 $1,578.19 $2,053.49 NB 

Lea·d Times 35 days N/A 25 days 25 days N/A 35 days 20 days 35 days 65 days 25 days 25 days 25 days 

Taylor $5,631.00 NB $1,595.00 $909.00 $5,955.00 $5,379.00 $4,522.00 $2,057.00 $3,838.00 $1,572.00 $2,044.00 NB 

Lead Times 30 days N/A 15 days 15 days 15 days 30days 15 days 60 days 30days 15 days 15 days 15 days 

Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 



37 

Baritone 
BIDDERS YEP-211 

Music and Arts $2,367.68 

Lead Times 31-60days

Playground 3% $2,220.00
Lead Times IN STOCK 

Sweetwater $2,050.58 
Lead Times 2S days 

Taylor $2,048.00 
Leaa Times 15 days 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 

Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

BID REQUEST 25-01- BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

38 39 40 41 

Trombone 
Trumpet Trombone stand Euphonium 
ETR-420 YSL-354 DS520B EEP321 

$405.83 $588.81 $42.05 $1,002.93 

7-14 days 7-14days 61-90days 91-120days

$410.00 $710.00 NB $1,005.00 

IN STOCK IN STOCK 

NB $523.02 $47.88 NB 

N/A 25 days 7 days N/A 

NB $577.00 $44.99 NB 

N/A 30-60 days 15 days N/A 

42 

Tuba MP 
Conn 120S 

$77.33 

7-14 days

NB

$57.S9 

20days 

$66.99 
15 days 

43 

Tuba 
EBB226 

$3,605.93 

61-90days

$3,475.00 

NB 

N/A 

NB 

N/A 

44 45 

Euphonium French Horn 
King 2280 Conn 6D 

$3,017.76 $4,042.45 

61-90days 181 + days 

$2,830.00 $3,790.00 

IN STOCK IN STOCK 

$2,450.38 $3,464.96 
Feb Feb 

$2,611.00 $3,463.00 
15 days 60-90 days 

46 47 48 

French 
Horn Conn Sousaphon Cornet Yer-

80 e JSP1010 23330111 

$5,153.64 $4,636.28 $769.44 

181 + days 31-60days 61-90 days

$4,820.00 $4,650.00 $725.00 
IN STOCK 

$4,417.60 $4,274.56 $533.11 

Feb 20days 25days 

$4,455.00 $4,284.00 $585.00 
15 days ls days 15 days 



BID REQUEST 25-01  BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

49 50 51 52 53 54 55 56 57 58 59 60 

French Trombone 
Sousaphon Sousaphone Sousaphon Sousaphon Horn TB-20LA 

eKing Adams eConn Sousaphon eConn Tuba Yamaha Mellopone Trombone Tuba Mellopone cannonball 
BIDDERS 2350WSP MSP1S 40KSPW e YSH411S 20KSPW EBB534 671 EMP304S JTB100F JTU700 YMP204M 

Music and Arts $9,812.09 $9,192.96 $12,157.86 $9,418.08 $11,147.24 $5,327.72 $4,768.96 $1,085.26 $1,138.16 $2,758.46 $1,788.64 $3,550.43 

Lead Times 181 + days 31-60 days 181 + days 151-180 days 181 + days 151-180 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 61-90 days 91-120 days 91-120 days 181 + days 

Playground 3% $9,033.00 $8,700.00 $11,855.00 $8,750.00 $10,202.00 $4,455.00 $4,800.00 $1,065.00 $1,183.00 $2,865.00 $1,550.00 NB 

Lead Times IN STOCK (ril STOCK IN STOCK 
Sweetwater $8,497.90 $7,871.47 $10,421.02 $8,156.73 $9,554.77 NB $4,130.26 NB $1,049.50 $2,543.23 $1,549.09 NB 

Lead Times May 35 days March March June N/A March N/A 35 days 20 days 35 days N/A 
Taylor $8,474.00 $7,887.00 $10,666.00 $8,128.00 $9,888.00 NB $4,090.00 NB $1,055.00 $2,555.00 $1,540.00 NB 

Leaa7imes 120-180 days 60-120 days 360 + days 240-300 days 15 days N/A Per Factory N/A Per Factory 15 days 30-45 days N/A 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 

Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 
Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 
' , , 

� 

61 

Euphoniu 
m 

EEP526G 

I sI $3,2s4.8s 

151-180 days
$3,198.00

NB 

N/A 

NB 

N/A 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

62 63 I 64 I 65 I 66 I 67 I 68 I 69 I 70 I 71 
I I I I I I I 

Trumpet Trombone 
Cannonbal MP Bach Sousapho Marching 

I826S 5G Trumpet Tuba Trumpet Trombone ne Trumpet Baritone Trombone 
Bach 3C EBB431 YTR-2330 YSL354 EPH495 ETR520S EMB411 ETB428 

$2,184.87 $68.03 $52.03 $4,380.94 $566.16 $588.81 $5,362.62 $705.94 $1,378.78 $991.89 
SUB 2?? 61-

90 days 7-14 days 7-14 days 181 + days 7-14 days 7-14 days 91-120 days 151-180 days 91-120 days 91-120 days
$1,200.00 NB NB $4,300.00 $710.00 $710.00 $4,997.00 $690.00 $1,350.00 $970.00

IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK
NB $38.76 $58.43 NB $523.02 $523.02 NB NB NB NB 

N/A 20 days 20 days N/A 2S days 25 days N]A N/A N/A N/A 

NB $59.99 $45.99 NB $577.00 $577.00 NB NB NB NB 

N/A 15 days 15 days N/A 15 days 15 days N/A N/A N/A N/A 



72 

Trombone 
BIDDERS YBL-421G 

Music and Arts $2,733.92 

Lead Times 91-120 days

Playground 3% $2,565.00

Lead Times 

Sweetwater $2,367.77 

Lead Times 35 days 

Taylor $2,373.00 

Lead Times Per Factory 

Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 

Pink Awarded 

NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

73 74 75 

Bass Drum 
Trumpet Marimba Adams Yamaha 

YCR2310 4.3 14" 

$769.44 $3,584.00 $461.44 

151-180 days 61-90days 91-120days

$725.00 $3,388.00 $440.00

IN STOCK IN STOCK 

$533.11 $3,068.80 $399.64 

25 days 20days June 

$588.00 $3,066.00 $520.00 

15 days 15 days 15 days 

76 

Bass Drum 

Yamaha 
16" 

$495.04 

31-60 days

$475.00

IN STOCK 

$428.74 

25 days 

$436.00 

SUB 15 days 

77 

Tenor 
heads 13" 

$15.34 

7-14 days

NB

$24.18 

30 days 

NB 

N/A 

78 79 

Tenor Tenor 
head 13" heads 12" 

$15.34 $14.59 

7-14days 7-14 days

NB NB

$24.18 $23.48 

30 days l0days 

NB NB 

N/A N/A 

80 81 82 

Snare 
heads 14" 

Tenor Snare dipomat 

heads 6" heads 14" coated 

$12.09 $13.SO $12.75 

7-14 days 7-14days 61-90days

NB NB NB

$16.63 $18.76 $17.96 

lOdays todays l0days 

NB NB NB 

N/A N/A N/A 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 
� - < �· 

� 

83 I 

Timpani 
heads 26" 

$84.21 

91-120 days
NB 

$89.24 
115 days 

NB 

N/A 

BID REQUEST 25-01  - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

84 I 85 I 86 I 87 I 88 I 89 I 90 I 91 
I I I I I 

Triple 
Snare drum guitar steel 

Mallets Mallets Mallets Mallets Mallets Mallets Pearl drums 
IP310 4B IP310 5B IP310 6B IP902 IP904 IP901 14x6.5" 

$40.24 $40.24 $40.24 $30.68 $30.68 $30,68 $270.07 NB 

151-180 days 7-14 days 7-14 days I 7-14 days I 7-14 days I 7-14 days I 31-60 days I N/A 

NB NB NB I NB I NB I NB I 660? I NB 

$42,89 $47.96 $42.89 $33.61 $33.83 $33.83 $230.64 NB 

35 days Hi days 35 days ib days io days 35 days 4 months N/A 

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

92 93 I 94 
I 

Triple Triple 
guitar steel Guitar Steel drum 
drum case steel drum guitar 

stand mallets 
NB NB NB 

I N/A I N/A I N/A 

I NB I NB I NB 

NB NB NB 

N/A N/A N/A 

NB NB NB 

N7A N/A N/A 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 
Lead Times 

Sweetwater 
Lead Times 

Taylor 
Lead Times 

Apple 
Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

,. 4 :-·... , .... - - • 
. ' 

95 I 

Drum 

PEASTP1 

I 455 

I $664.16 

91-120days
$635.00

IN STOCK
$572.25
20days
$577.00

is days

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

96 97 98 I 99 I 100 I 101 I 102 I 103 I 104 I 105 

I I 
Snare Glockenspiel 

Case Hum W field 5.0 Octave Percussion 
DR474BK Timpani Frame Marimba Workstatio Bell Tree Timpani Timpani Timpani Timpani 

SP Throne GAF33 MAKF50 n MEI-BT27 TP-3332 TP-3323 TP-4332R TP-4323R 

$80.27 $192.63 $6,456.80 $16,643.20 $1,463.32 $255.76 $4,954.88 $4,649.12 $2,924.32 $2,499.28 
SUB61-90 

121-150 days 151-180 days 61-90 days 61-90davs days 31-60 days �51-180 days 151-180 day! 31-60days 31-60 days
NB NB $5,944.00 $18,075.00 NB $310.00 $2,323.00 $2,179.00 $2,637.00 $2,343.00

IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK IN STOCK
NB NB $5,528.64 $16,998.28 NB $277.13 $2,145.64 $2,013.24 $2,532.67 $2,164.56
N/A N/A 20 days 2() days N/A 25 days 25 days 45 days 35 days
NB NB $5,494.00 $16,996.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB 

N/A N/A 15 days is days N[A N/A N7A N/A N/A N/A 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Tirnes 
Taylor 

Lead Tfmes 
Apple 
Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 
' . . . , . .

� . ..... 

106 

Bongos 
Primera 
series 

$113.85 

7-14 days
NB

NB 

N/A 

$99.00 
15 days 

BID REQUEST 25-01- BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

107 

Congas w/ 
PC300W 
stand 

$502.85 

31-60 days
NB

NB 

N/A 

$330.00 
15 days 

108 

Snare Drum 
Head 14" 

$16.91 

91-120 days
NB

NB 

N/A 

NB 

N/A 

109 

Giro LP243 
$30.51 

7-14 days
NB

$40.34 
7 days 

NB 

N/A 

110 

Timbales LP 
M257B 

$375.27 

61-90 days I
NB I 

$383.23 
7 days 

NB 

N/A 

111 112 113 

Marching Marching 
Marching snare PEA- Tenor PEA-
snare head FFXM1412/A PMTM68023/ 
13" 46 A46 

$778.40 $1,391.04 

NB 181 + days 31-60 days
NB $735.00 $1,305.00 

INSTOCk IN STOCK 

NB $670.68 $1,198.53 
N7A 20 days 35 days 
NB $676.00 $1,199.00 
N/A 15 days 3Q..60 days 

114 115 

Marching Marching 
Bass PEA- Bass PEA-
PBDM1814/A PBDM1614/A 
46 46 

$696.64 $675.36 

61-90 days 31-60 days
$655.00 $640.00 

iNSTOCK IN STOCK 

$600.23 $581.90 
20days 20 days 
$601.00 $588.00 
15 days lSc!ay_s 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

.:l;i"t�>· �{��� ,.;"-:v��,.��7"""Y:_ 

116 

Marching 
Bass PEA-
PBDM2414/A 
46 

$797.44 

61-90 days

$755.00
IN STOCK 

$687.08 
20 days 
$692.00 
15 days 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

117 

Marching 
Bass PEA-
PBDM2814/A 
46 

$907.20 

61-90 days
$855.00

IN STOCK

$781.65
20 days
$788.00
15 days

118 

Trumpet 
mute 
DW5504 

$34.72 

7-14 days

NB

$37.99 
7 days 
$33.99 
� d_ays 

119 120 

Trombone 
Bari Sax 

Mute Humes 
R d 3 

& Berg 151 
ee s 

$17.85 $38.62 

7-14 days 7-14 days
NB NB

$22.96 $37.82 
7 days 7 days 
$23.99 $3S.99 
15 days 15 _clays 

121 122 123 

Tenor sax 
Contra alto J88A 
clarinet reeds Penetrating 

reeds 3 
sz3 corrosion oil 

$21.65 $52.00 NB 

7-14 days 7-14 days N/A 

NB NB NB 

$23.41 NB NB 

7 days N/A N/A 

$19.99 $48.99 $18.99 
1S days 15 days 30 days 

- --

124 125 

Tuning Slide 
J88B Oil refill 

Pliers E90 

NB NB 

N/A N/A 

NB NB 

NB NB 

N/A N/A 
$27.99 $84.99 
30days 30 days 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

., ',,. • -

� 1, 

� 

BID REQUEST 25 -01- BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

126 I 127 I 128 129 130 131 132 133 

Tuning Slide 
!
Tuning Slide 

'
Dial Caliper 

I
Tuning Slide Sax Post Pioneer Color guard Color Guard 

Pliers E92 Pliers E94 G24A Removing raising Tool Reciever padded bag Glag Bag 
ToolL13 N60 VSX-LX105 60121 58116/Black 

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NiA N/A NiA 
$117.99 $117.99 $51.99 $91.99 $61.99 NB NB NB 

30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days l'f/A NIA NfA 

134 135 

Color Guard Drumset 

Rifle 60611 Throne 
9608MB 

NB $205.26 

N/A 7-14 days
NB NB

NB $198.01 
N/A 7 days 

NB NB 

NIA N/A 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

� 

136 

Marimba 
Mallets Jim 
Casella 
IP1001 

$35.21 

7-14 days
NB 

$38.35 
7 days 

$36.99 
15 days 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

137 

Marimba Mallets 
Jim Casella 
IP1002 

$35.21 

7-14 days
NB

$38.35 
7 days 

$36.99 
15 days 

138 

Marimba 
Mallets Jim 
Casella 
IP1003 

$35.21 

7-14 days
NB

$38.13 
7 days 

$36.99 
15 daus 

139 

Vibraphone 
Mallets Jim 
Casella 
IP1006B 

$35.21 

7-14 days
NB

$43.20 
7 days 
$36.99 
15 days 

140 141 142 143 

Mallet Bag Bass drum Bass drum Bass Drum 
MB1 small mallet FBX2 mallet FBX3 Mallet FBX4 

$47.78 $31.05 $33.74 $40.16 

7-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days
NB NB NB NB 

$55.11 NB NB NB 

7 days NIA NTA NIA 

$51.99 $31.99 $33.99 $39.99 
30 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 

144 145 

Macbook Air 
Bass Drum 

5pk 
mallet FBX5 

BWZP2LL/A 

$45.13 

7-14 days
NB

NB 

fJJA 

$44.99 
15 days 

$5,590.00 

3-4weeks



BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND I N STRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

146 147 148 149 150 151 152 153 154 155 
Marimba 

Bass head Bass head Bass head Bass Head Bass Head Bass Head 
microphone Dynamic Microphone 

Powermax 2 Powermax2 Powermax 2 Powermax2 Powermax2 Powermax 2 
Replacement 

system Microphones shock mount 
REM-PM- REM-PM- REM-PM- REM-PM- REM-PM- REM-PM-

Wheel ADM-
SM137Mar8 SM57 AT8401A 

2416-MP 2418-MP 2420-MP 2422-MP 2424-MP 2428-MP 
PBW18 

BIDDERS un 
Music and Arts $162.92 $73.11 $31.50 $33.05 $35.19 $36.17 $39.40 $41.94 $50.07 $45.24 

Lead Times 181 + days 7-14 days 91-120 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 31-60 days 7-14 days

Playground 3% $510.00 $95.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

Lead Times 
Sweetwater $222.61 $83.71 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 
Lead Times 7 days 7 days NIA WA NIA NIA NlA N7A NlA NIA 

Taylor NB $81.00 NB $46.99 $48.99 $49.99 $53.99 $56.99 $69.99 $41.99 

Lead Times NIA 15 days N7A 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days f5 days 15 days 
Apple 

Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 

- � y,;-u, �·,a;,� ��� 



BIDDERS 

Music and Arts 

Lead Times 
Playground 3% 
Lead Times 
Sweetwater 

Lead Times 
Taylor 

Lead Times 
Apple 
Lead Times 

Key: 
Pink Awarded 
NB= NO BID 
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument 
\; ' • J •• ' • -'. 

BID REQUEST 25-01 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM 

156 I 157 I 158 159 160 161 162 163 

Winterguard Harmony Clarinet 
Flag Poles 6' I Floor 13oz Baritone Sax Flip Folder Director Wireless PA Reeds 

black reeds size 3 5885 HD300 Megavox2 CR103 Sax Reeds 
, SR2125 

$11.34 NB $38.62 $5.58 $563.87 $2,406.90 $22.99 $29.90 

31-60 days N/A 7-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days 181 + days I 7-14 days I 7-14 days
NB NB NB NB $540.00 $2,155.00 I NB I NB 

IN STOCK 

NB NB $37.82 $4.65 $484.03 $1,524.55 $24.57 $30.31 
NIA NIA 7 days 7 days 35 days 7 days 7 days 7 days 
NB NB $36.99 $5.95 $505.00 $1,888.00 $22.99 $28.99 
N/A NIA 15 days 15 days 15 cfays 15 days 15 days 15 days 

164 I 165 

Multi I 

Orchestral Service/ 
Stand Repair/ Refur 
DS5388 per hr 

$69.50 85.00 HR 

I 61-90 days 
I NB I 75.00 HR 

$73.06 
7 days 

NB 

N/A 




